
RFB 2014-0130-FE

Fire Extinguisher Bid Tab

 SFA Fire 

Protection 

 Carolina Fire 

Systems 

 Unifour Fire and 

Safety 

 Sisco Fire and 

Safety 

 Simplex 

Grinnell 

Hood 

Inspections 85.00$               75.00$                60.00$                   60.00$                 40.00$              

Fusible Link (EA) 10.00$               8.00$                  6.00$                     5.50$                   7.00$                

Service Call (per 

site) 35.00$               30.00$                No Service Call 25.00$                 25.00$              

Cost per 

Extinguisher 

Inspected 4.00$                 3.00$                  2.75$                     1.00$                   2.00$                

2 1/2 lb ABC 15.00$               12.50$                10.00$                   11.50$                 15.00$              

5 lb ABC 18.00$               14.50$                11.00$                   16.00$                 22.00$              

10 lb ABC 21.00$               19.50$                14.00$                   25.00$                 25.00$              

20 lb ABC 32.00$               24.50$                20.00$                   45.00$                 34.00$              

Class "ABC" 

Powder per lb 2.12$                 No Charge 2.00$                     1.00$                   2.25$                

5 lb CO2 28.50$               8.00$                  32.00$                   N/A 22.50$              

10 lb CO2 32.50$               15.00$                36.00$                   N/A 26.50$              

20 lb CO2 36.00$               30.00$                44.00$                   N/A 34.00$              

Class "K" 6 L 125.00$            85.00$                70.00$                   82.50$                 82.00$              

Class "K" 2 1/2 

gal 140.00$            125.00$              70.00$                   82.50$                 98.50$              

2 1/2 lb ABC 11.00$               8.00$                  8.00$                     10.00$                 11.00$              

5 lb ABC 14.00$               10.00$                9.00$                     11.00$                 16.00$              

10 lb ABC 17.00$               15.00$                12.00$                   19.00$                 19.00$              

20 lb ABC 28.00$               20.00$                18.00$                   38.00$                 30.00$              

Class "ABC" 

Powder per lb 2.12$                 No Charge 2.00$                     1.00$                   2.25$                

5 lb CO2 8.50$                 8.00$                  18.00$                   9.00$                   12.00$              

10 lb CO2 12.50$               15.00$                22.00$                   11.00$                 16.00$              

20 lb CO2 16.00$               30.00$                30.00$                   15.00$                 24.00$              

50 lb CO2 62.50$               50.00$                60.00$                   26.00$                 44.00$              

80 lb CO2 100.00$            80.00$                90.00$                   43.00$                 64.00$              

100 lb CO2 125.00$            125.00$              125.00$                 53.00$                 85.00$              

Class "K" 6 L 105.00$            100.00$              60.00$                   65.50$                 82.00$              

Class "K" 2 1/2 

gal 120.00$            125.00$              60.00$                   65.50$                 95.00$              

5 lb CO2 28.50$               18.00$                32.00$                   20.00$                 22.50$              

10 lb CO2 32.50$               18.00$                36.00$                   20.00$                 26.50$              

20 lb CO2 36.00$               18.00$                40.00$                   20.00$                 34.00$              

Annual Inspections

Bi-Annual Inspections

Hydrostat - 6 yr. Maintenance

Refill and Recharge

5 yr Hydrostat Inspections Cost (EA)



RFB 2014-0130-FE

Fire Extinguisher Bid Tab

 SFA Fire 

Protection 

 Carolina Fire 

Systems 

 Unifour Fire and 

Safety 

 Sisco Fire and 

Safety 

 Simplex 

Grinnell 

2 1/2 lb ABC 23.00$               20.00$                14.00$                   12.00$                 15.00$              

5 lb ABC 26.00$               22.00$                15.00$                   23.00$                 22.00$              

10 lb ABC 29.00$               27.00$                18.00$                   31.00$                 25.00$              

20 lb ABC 40.00$               32.00$                26.00$                   45.00$                 34.00$              

18 lb Foam 40.00$               15.00$                50.00$                   40.00$                 40.00$              

27 lb Foam 49.50$               15.00$                75.00$                   60.00$                 65.00$              

Class "K" 6 L N/A 15.00$                70.00$                   82.50$                 82.50$              

Class "K" 2 1/2 

gal N/A 15.00$                70.00$                   82.50$                 98.50$              

2 1/2 lb ABC 28.00$               32.75$                35.00$                   32.00$                 31.00$              

5 lb ABC 45.50$               46.95$                45.00$                   41.00$                 40.00$              

10 lb ABC 63.50$               59.95$                70.00$                   58.00$                 58.00$              

20 lb ABC 110.50$            95.95$                120.00$                 103.00$               96.00$              

Class "K" 6 L 188.00$            132.95$              190.00$                 145.00$               147.00$            

Class "K" 2 1/2 

gal 227.00$            No Bid 190.00$                 150.75$               N/A

Sheriff's 

Detention 

Center Price p/ device No Bid 185.00$                 200.00$               300.00$            

Citizens Center Price p/ device No Bid 150.00$                 200.00$               300.00$            

Old Hospital Price p/ device No Bid 710.00$                 200.00$               800.00$            

Citizens Center Price p/ device No Bid 250.00$                 75.00$                 280.00$            

BOA Price p/ device No Bid 250.00$                 75.00$                 290.00$            

DSS Price p/ device No Bid 425.00$                 75.00$                 600.00$            

Health Dept. Price p/ device No Bid 250.00$                 75.00$                 600.00$            

Gaston College/ 

Senior Center Price p/ device No Bid 500.00$                 75.00$                 700.00$            

Jerry Cochran 

Bldg. (Gaston 

College) Price p/ device No Bid 250.00$                 75.00$                 400.00$            

EMS - Central Price p/ device No Bid 325.00$                 75.00$                 300.00$            

East Lincoln 

Rec. Center Price p/ device No Bid 250.00$                 75.00$                 336.00$            

Sheriff's 

Detention 

Center Price p/ device No Bid 500.00$                 75.00$                 580.00$            

12 yr Hydrostat Inspections Cost (EA)

Replacement Cost

Sprinkler Testing

Alarm Testing



RFB 2014-0130-FE

Fire Extinguisher Bid Tab

 SFA Fire 

Protection 

 Carolina Fire 

Systems 

 Unifour Fire and 

Safety 

 Sisco Fire and 

Safety 

 Simplex 

Grinnell 

Old Hospital Price p/ device No Bid 745.00$                 75.00$                 1,680.00$        

LC Water 

Treatment Plant Price p/ device No Bid 250.00$                 75.00$                 280.00$            

Sheriff's 

Detention 

Center 375.00$            375.00$              500.00$                 225.00$               500.00$            

East Lincoln 

Rec. Center 375.00$            375.00$              300.00$                 225.00$               400.00$            

Gaston College/ 

Senior Center 375.00$            375.00$              300.00$                 225.00$               400.00$            

LC Water 

Treatment Plant 75.00$               No Bid 60.00$                   75.00$                 58.33$              

Total 3,372.74$         2,744.55$          13,612.75$           3,862.75$            10,577.33$      

Total Minus No 

Bid or N/A 

Items 3,070.74$         2,714.55$          2,757.75$             2,047.00$            2,809.00$        

Service Call X 45 

Sites 1,575.00$         1,350.00$          0 1,125.00$            1,125.00$        

Total Minus No 

Bid + Service 

Call 4,645.74$         4,064.55$          2,757.75$             3,172.00$            3,934.00$        

Total + Service 

Call 4,947.74$         4,094.55$          13,612.75$           4,987.75$            11,702.33$      

Award To: Sisco Fire and Safety

Back Flow Preventer

Hood Cleaning


